ISSN 0856 — 034X

Supplement No. 47 01" December, 2017

SUBSIDIARY LEGISLATI ON

10 the Gazette of the United Republic of Tanzania No. 48 Vol. 08 dated 01° December. 2017
Printed by the Government Printer Dar es Salaam by Order of Government

GOVERNMENT NOTICE NO. 471 published on 01/12/2017
THE PUBLIC PROCUREMENT APPEALS RULES

(GN.NO. 411 OF 2014)

RULES

(Made under section 105)

THE PUBLIC PROCUREMENT APPEALS (AMENDMENT) RULES, 2017

Construction 1. These Rules may be cited as the Public Procurement Appeals

Sg‘]z'ol\]]g' 411 (Amendment) Rules, 5017 and shall be read as one with the Public
Procurement Appeals Rules, 7014 hereinafter referred to as the
“principal Rules™.

Amendment 2. The principal Rules is amended in rule 3 by inserting in it
of Rule 3 alphabetical order the following definition:-
“cpplication” means a formal request in writing, made
by the applicant for a certain order before the Appeals

Authority;”.
Amendment 3. The principal Rules is amended in Rule 6 by:-
of Rule 6 (a) adding the reference to section «59(2)” immediately
after the word “sections” appearing in the open words to
Rule 6;

(b) adding the word “unjustified” before the word
“rejections” appearing in paragraph (g).



Public Procurement Appeals (Amendment)

Government Notice No. 471 (contd...)

Revocation
of
Rule 8

Amendment
of Rule 9

Amendment
of Rule 10

Amendment
of Rule 11

Amendment
of Rule 12

Amendment
of Rule 13

Amendment
of Rule 17

4. The principal Rules is amended by revoking Rule 8.

5. The principal Rules is amended in Rule 9 by deleting the
word “fourteen days” and substituting for it the word “seven
working days” appearing in sub-rule (1).

6. The principal Rule is amended in Rule 10 by deleting sub-
rule (1) and substituting for it the following:-

“(1) The appeal under Rule 8 shall be in
writing or in electronic form and shall be filled in
accordance with PPAA Form No. 1 as set out in the
First Schedule to these Rules™.

7. The principal Rules is amended in Rule 11 by deleting the
word “No. 77 and substituting for it the word “No.6”.

8. The principal Rules is amended in Rule 12 by:-

(a) inserting the phrase “in the format set out in Form No.2
prescribed in the First Schedule” between the words
“submission” and “to the Appeals” appearing in sub-rule
(2)

(b) revoking sub-rule (3) and (4);

(¢) renumbering sub-rules (5) and (6) as sub-rules (3) and
(4) respectively; and

(d) deleting sub-rule (4) as renumbered and substituting for
it the following.

“(4) A tenderer may, at any time before the
hearing of the appeal and upon filing a statement
indicating reasons thereof, join as a party 1o the
proceedings:

Provided that no statement shall be
entertained by the Appeals authority if it is lodged
less than three working days before the hearing
date”.

9. The principal Rules is amended in Rule 13(2) by deleting
the word “five days” appearing in paragraph (b) and substituting for
it the word “three working days”.

10. The principal Rules is amended in Rule 17 by deleting
the words “in its discretion,” appearing in sub-rule (1) and

2



Public Procurement Appeals (Amendment)
Government Notice No. 471 (contd...)

substituting for it the words “on its own motion”.

Amendment 11. The principal Rules is amended in Rule 18 by deleting
ofRule 18 the words “Form PPAA No4” and substituting for it the words
“Form PPAA No.3” appearing in sub-rule (2).

Amendment 12. The principal Rules is amended in Rule 20 by:-
of Rule 20 (a) deleting the word “No.6” appearing in sub-rule (2) and
substituting for it the word “No.5%;

(b) deleting the phrase “Form No.8 as set out in the First
schedule” appearing in sub-rule (3) and substituting for
it the following phrase: “Form No.7 as set out in the
First Schedule.”

Amendment 13. The principal Rules is amended in Rule 23 by deleting the
ofRule23  word “No.5” appearing in sub-rule (2) and substituting for it the
word “No.4”. '

Amendment 14. The principal Rules is amended in Rule 27 by:-
of Rule 27 (a) adding the word “working” between the words “seven”
and “days” appearing in sub-rule (1); and
(b) adding the word “working” between the words “seven”
and “days” appearing in sub-rule (4).

Amendment 15. The principal Rules is amended in Rule 28 by deleting

of Rule28  figure “10” and substituting for it with figure “9”.

Amendment 16. The principal Rules is amended in Rule 30 by:-

of Rule 30 (a) deleting sub-rule (2) and substituting for it the
following:-

“(2) The respondent shall file his reply, if
any, within five working days from the date of
receipt of the statement of appeal.”

(b) deleting the word “3 days” and substituting for it the
phrase “three working days” appearing in sub-rule (3);

(c) deleting the phrase “Form No.5 as set out in the first
Schedule” appearing “form No.4 as set out it the First
Schedule”.

General 17. The principal Rules is amended by renumbering Rule 9,
amendment 10 11...33” as Rule 8,9, 10...31” respectively.



Public Procurement Appeals (Amendment)

Gaovernment Notice No. 471 (contd...)

Additional 18. The principal Rules is amended by adding immediately

of after Rule 31 as renumbered the following new Rule 32 as follows:-

v “Execution 32.-(1) A decree holder of the decision
ggct:}':;on of the Appeals Authority shall execute the

decision by making an application to the
Appeals Authority using PPAA Form
No.7 and the Appeals Authority shall
issue a decree or order authorising
execution.

(2) Execution of the decree or an order
issued by the Appeals Authority shall be
Cap33 carried out in accordance with the
provisions of the Civil Procedure Code.

(3) A decree shall be extracted from
the decision of the Appeals Authority and
shall be signed by the Chairperson of the
Appeals Authority or their successor in
office, as the case may be, or the
Executive Secretary.

(4) The decree shall contain,
among other things, the Appeal case or
registration number, the names and
descriptions of the parties and particulars
of the claim, and shall specify clearly the
award or reliefs granted or other
determination of the appeal.

(5) Notwithstanding sub-rule ([l
No application for execution shall be
entertained by the Appeals Authority until
after the expiry of fourteen days from the
date on which a decision or order of the
Appeals Authority was made”.

Amendment 19. The principal Rules is amended in the Schedule by:-
of the (a) deleting the enabling provisions and substituting for it
Schedule .
the following:-
“(Made under Rules g g ir i3 1o 4% 22 29
and 33)7;
(b) deleting PPAA Form No.1; and
(¢) renumbering PPAA Form No.2 to PPAA Form No.8 as
PPAA Form No.1 to PPAA Form No.7 respectively.



Public Procurement Appeals (Amendment)
Government Notice No. 471 (contd...)

Additional 20. The First Schedule to the principal Rules is amended by
g{)i ‘E‘lfmm adding immediately after PPAA Form No.7 as renumbered the
following new PPAA Form No.8 as follows:-



Public Procurement Appeals (Amendment)

Government Notice No. 471 (contd...)

114

PPAA FORM NO.8

IN THE PUBLIC PROCUREMENT APPEALS
AUTHORITY

REHENT 4P,
¢ 8 %%.
s, %
& 2

T e

PEAA

WARLALA 1A RUFAR T4 ZEHOY TAENRR

HOLDER
AND
..................... NDEBTOR
APPLICATION FOR EXECUTION OF DECREE

(Under O, 21 r 11of CPC and Rule 33 of the Appeals
Rules)

et decree holder, hereby apply for
execution of the decree herein as set forth below.

Date OFf ECIEE. ...eeiveerreerierreerre e s sie s
Whether any appeal preferred from decree!..................
Payment or adjustment, if any:-

Previous application, if any with date and

Amount with interest due upon

the decree ‘|
or other
relief
granted
thereby
together with particulars

of any cross decree:-

Amount of costs, if any awarded.

Against whom to be executed:-
Mode in which the assistance of the Appeals
Authority is required:-



Public Procurement Appeals (Amendment)

Government Notice No. 471 (conid...)

Decree Holder

FOR OFFICIAL USE ONLY:

Received by PPAA on the......... day of ...... 20:0
Al (am/pm)

NTTEIE oo w3 s S S o S e A T
DESIZNALION. ... vvvasaarieemenssr s srrani et
SIERATITG wrewsswemprsiiens Official stamp..ccoveumsesss

Copy of the Application to be served upon:-

AR S S s e v s o e AR e e S A A e e =
DIAEEE 5 insvons sioiow ssmrein mes s sy SmE RS R S ST et
RSP 1T: 31O SR L L
DeSIgNAtioN:. .. covvernnmrrreciiun s

OFficial SEAMP..c.ievveevnermieeee o irssesreeeees 7



Public Procurement Appeals (Amendment)
Government Notice No. 471 (contd...)

Amendment 21. The principal Rules is amended in the Second Schedule
gzi‘)‘i . by deleting it and substituting for it the following:-
Schedule

SECOND SCHEDULE

(Made under Rule 13)

FEE PAYABLE

S/N Subject matter Amount

in Shs.
I On submission of appeal 300,000/=
On opting to join to the proceedings 300.000/=
On application to set aside ex parte 1,000,000/=

decision

. On application for extension of time 300,000/=
3. For withdrawal of appeal 1,000,000/=

6. On application for execution of the 150,000/= |
decree/ order

Dodoma, PHILIP [. MPANGO,
14" June, 2017 Minster for Finance and Planning



